
Military Diploma 

This document is my diploma that I received from my military engineering class and this diploma
was given with a high grade. I have very interesting memories about my term in the military. After
my training, I was given a diploma that stated my graduation status as a reserve officer. It also
says "very good," referring to the degree with which I finished my term. When it was my time I
enrolled in the military as a reserve officer. I had a very comfortable military experience. I was
involved im repairing train tracks since I was an engineer. I have very interesting memories about
my term in the military. After my training, I was given a diploma that stated my graduation status
as a reserve officer. It also says "very good," referring to the degree with which I finished my term.
Back then, there was an exam called the platoon exam. The exam consisted of questions for the
purpose of testing what kinds of strategies an officer would implement given a particular situation.
I was asked a difficult question. Hypothetically, if I had not ordered my men to withdraw, my
platoon would have suffered tremendous losses. But, I was not sure if I was brave enough to say
this out loud. In the end, I did, and suggested to my commanders that maybe we should consider a
voluntary attempt to withdraw rather than shooting blind at the enemy. I thought that human loss
could be minimized this way. I believe that by offering this scenario, I was able to cause a change
of mentality in the military. I was able to emphasize the importance of a voluntary and conscious
attempt to withdraw. I was rewarded by full marks on my diploma. I was enlisted in the military in
1950 as a reserve officer. I actually was enlisted before my mandatory military attendance date. I
tried to network as much as I could so that I could finish my military term as quickly as possible. I
began my military duties as a naval officer first (assigned to me by lottery). There were not any
ranks in the naval forces in regards to architectural engineering, so I was ordered to wear the
uniform of ground forces. I worked in the construction of a building in Heybeliada that is currently
used as a military school. My commanding officers really liked my work, so they asked me what I
wanted in return. One of my painter friends was also in the military at the time. I asked my officers
if it was possible to station my friend to my unit so that he could help me with the drawings for the
construction. In this respect, I was able to facilitate the relocation of one of my friends, and have
him work with me. I knew he was having a very difficult time at his previous location. On Election
Day, which resulted in a victory for the Democrats, a curfew was enacted for military officers. We
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could not go out on the streets, so I was sitting at the military headquarters. My commanding
officer, who was residing at a nearby building close to sea level, summoned me to his quarters. I
received permission to leave, and went to see him. I remember seeing a high-rank officer sitting
across from my commander. My commander asked the officer to leave, so I could sit down. Rank is
a very important concept in the military. To be honest, I was scared because I did not know what to
expect. In the meantime, the soldiers in the streets were busy with preparation efforts for the 19
May national holiday. They were performing acrobatic dances on a large, iron construction. My
commander asked me whether I thought the construction was strong. I told him that I did not think
the construction was sufficiently solid, and that there was a very good chance it could cave in. I
also walked him through the steps that should be taken in order to make it stronger and more
durable. In this way, I was able to correct some of the construction mistakes, and prevent a
possible disaster from ever happening. My observation on this matter was very well received by my
commander.
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