
Mark Derbaremdiker's Family 

This is our family photo, taken in Kiev in 1945. Sitting are my mother Perl Derbaremdiker, nee
Kventsel, and my father Levi-Itshak Derbaremdiker. Standing, from left to right: my older brother
Abram Derbaremdiker, I and my younger brother Yontoh Derbaremdiker. My father and mother
were introduced to one another in 1911. On some Jewish holiday their mothers met in the
synagogue, discussed the issue with other relatives and arranged that they should meet each
other. The young people liked each other and got married in 1912. They had a Jewish wedding with
a chuppah, a bunch of relatives as guests, and there were merry songs and dances, freilakh. My
older brother Abram was born in 1913. He studied in cheder and then, after the Revolution, in a
Ukrainian school for a few years. He studied for eight years and entered a Jewish technical school.
He studied very well. Before the war he finished the physics and mathematics department of
Berdichev Pedagogical Institute. Then he was recruited to the army and was on the front during the
war. After the war Abram decided to change his profession and entered the Academy of
Agriculture. He became a specialist in the field of electrification of the agricultural sector. He
worked in Lvov for many years. In 1947 he married his co-student Fania, who is also a Jew, of
course. In a year their son Eduard was born. They are a wonderful family. They emigrated to the
USA in 1990 and live in New York now. My brother and his wife are pensioners and Eduard is a
programmer. My younger brother Yontoh, or Yan, followed them to New York in the 1990s. Yontoh
was born in 1923. He finished school before the war and was recruited to the army. He served as a
private at the front during the war. Thank God he survived and came back. He studied at the Kiev
Institute of Light Industry and became a good footwear specialist. He lives in New York with his
family now. His son Peter, born in 1956, became a businessman and his grandson Igor works in a
bank. Both my brothers are active members of the Jewish community in New York; they live a
Jewish life. They promote the Jewish culture and Yiddish. We write to each other and they often call
me on the phone. We have been very close throughout our life.
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